
Happy November from the library! Not much is going on other than getting 
some new reading material for all ages. I am always here for you guys to come 
in or even call and tell me about books you would like to see be brought into 
the library.  

I still have some free books for kids to come grab, please come take some. The 
witch that came and cursed me for Halloween was true to her word. The books 
did in fact multiply. Please come and grab what you want for you little one.

Next week I will not be here for the two days that we are going to be open 
however I do have some amazing women coming to fill in on those days while I 
am gone down to Idaho. A HUGE thank you for Sheri Harvey and Ellen Britton, 
these ladies are simply amazing, and I truly appreciate them for coming in to 
help me out. 

What am I reading? So, the second book of the Baker Street mystery is called 
“Murder is a piece of Cake” and oh boy the DRAMA and murder in this town 
makes it so hard to put this book down. Mady and her baker street gang 
figured out who killed the mayor; however, the other murder that was talked 
about was Mady's great Aunt Octavia! Who would kill this amazing baker? You 
slowly start to follow Mady as she pieces it together and all the while getting 
better at baking but having her baking mishaps posted online. However, the 
media likes seeing her mess up to help them feel more at ease knowing that 
even professionals mess up. On top of that poor Mady can't catch a break or 
keep her temper because there was yet ANOTHER murder in her bakery. 
Although not going to lie after reading about this guy you aren't really 
surprised. He was murdered but who did the murdering did throw me off a bit. 
But there are still loose ends as well as hints to tell you who really did kill great 
Aunt Octavia.

This series was so hard for me to put down. I did finish the series in two weeks! I 
highly recommend this for someone who wants a mystery mixed with humor. 


